


Summary 

Scott Stability Ltd, a subsidiary of Noriker Power Ltd is proposing 
a 350MW battery storage facility (BESS), with associated 
infrastructure and development. Following due process, including 
pre-application consultation and submission of an EIA Screening 
request, the application is submitted to the ECU of the Scottish 
Government for consent and deemed planning permission. South 
Ayrshire Council has determined that an EIA is not required on the 
basis that it is unlikely to result in effects on the environment which 
are sufficiently significant to require the submission of an 
environmental assessment. The ECU formal Screening Opinion is 
awaited. The site is located within the countryside, but lies outside 
any specifically designated site in terms of heritage and the 
environment (landscape, visual and ecological). It is lower grade 
agricultural land and lies at a relative distance from sensitive 
receptors such as residential dwellings. Policies in the Revised 
NPF4 and the SALDP support the proposed development. The 
application is supported by a number of assessments which 
consider the merits of the proposal in relation to relevant material 
considerations, and which conclude, subject to mitigation, which is 
proposed as part of the application, that the development will not 
cause any significant adverse impact to matters which should be 
protected. Accordingly, the proposed development is consistent 
with the NPF4 and SALDP. There is a clear need for facilities for 
the storage of energy and the proposal meets the national focus to 
improve renewable energy provision. 
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